

BID ANALYSIS

TOWN OF WESTERLY

VEHICLE REPLACEMENT - DPW

Bid Number: **2021-012** At Opening: Jon S.

Prepared by: **M. Bednarski**

DATE: **3/30/2021**

	Bald Hill		Gervais Ford		Tasca Ford		Liberty Chevy		AT Northen		Minuteman Truck	
	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
Base Bid TOTAL		\$265,166.00		\$238,674.00		\$218,462.00		\$81,000.00		\$215,734.00		\$196,778.00

Base Bid Breakdown

2	2021 5500 Dump Truck or Equivalent	\$83,295.50	\$166,591.00	\$79,069.00	\$158,138.00	\$73,205.00	\$146,410.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$107,867.00	\$215,734.00	\$98,389.00	\$196,778.00
	Manufacture		Dodge		Ford		Ford		NA		International		Ford
2	2021 3/4 Ton HD Reg. Cab Long Bed Truck 4 WD or Equivalent	\$49,287.50	\$98,575.00	\$40,268.00	\$80,536.00	\$36,026.00	\$72,052.00	\$40,500.00	\$81,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	Manufacture		Dodge		Ford		Ford		Chevy		NA		NA

Digital Copy	YES
Delivery/Start Date	150 Days
Exclusions	See Bid
Deviated From Spec	See Bid
Acknowledge Addendum #1	YES
Signed our Bid Form	YES

YES
NS
See Bid
See Bid
YES
YES

YES
120-150
See Bid
See Bid
YES
YES

YES
14 Days
See Bid
See Bid
YES
YES

Blank
280 Days
See Bid
See Bid
YES
YES

NS
NS
See Bid
NO
YES
YES